ORDINANCE NO. 6741

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THE CODE OF ORDINANCES,
CITY OF KINGSPORT, TENNESSEE, SECTIONS 22-96, 22-121,
22-391, 22-411, 22-522 AND 42-46 RELATING TO ADOPTION BY
REFERENCE OF VARIOUS INTERNATIONAL CODES
PERTAINING TO PROPERTY; AND TO FIX THE EFFECTIVE
DATE OF THIS ORDINANCE

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY OF KINGSPORT, as follows:

SECTION |. That Section 22-96 of the Code of Ordinances, City of Kingsport, Tennessee,
is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 22-96. Code adopted by reference.

{a) Building Code. The provisions of the Internationa! Building Code, 2018 edition, including
appendices B, C, J, and K, published by the International Code Council, are hereby
adopted by reference as though copied verbatim in this subsection. One copy of said code
and revisions thereto was on fite in the office of the city recorder for a period of 15 days
prior to adoption, and the one copy of said code and revisions thereto shall remain on file
in the office of the city recorder for public use, inspection and examination. The
International Building Code, 2018 edition is hereby amended as follows:

Section 104 is amending by adding a new section to read “104.10.2 All references
to flood prone areas contained within this code shall comply with Kingsport's duly
adopted Flood Insurance Program requirements as shown on the current Flood
Insurance Rate Maps (FIRM) or the Flood Boundary and Floodway Maps (FBFM)
provided by the National Flood Insurance Program. Any conflicts between the
requirements contained herein and those contained in the Flood Insurance
Program, the duly adopted Flood Insurance Program shall apply.”

Section 105.2 pertaining to work exempt from permit is amended by deleting the
phrase "Fences not over 7 feet (2133 mm) high” and in lieu thereof substituting the
phrase ‘Fences not aver 8 feet high.”

Section 202 pertaining to definitions is pursuant to TCA § 68-120-101(a)}(8)(C)(i){a}
amended by deleting the definition of TOWNHQUSE in its entirety and in lieu
thereof substituting the phrase “A single-family dwelling unit constructed in a group
of three or more attached units in which each unit is separated by a 2 hour fire wali
extending from foundation to roof and with a yard or public way on not less than
two sides being exempt from sprinkler requirements of Section R313.1 and Section
P2904 of the IRC, however, if a sprinkler system is installed it shall meet the
requirements of these sections.”

Section 3301.1 pertaining to the scope is amended by adding the following
language at the end of the section “The provisions of this chapter shall not apply
when in conflict with the Tennessee Occupational Safety and Health Act (TOSHA)
or other applicable local, State or Federal requirements affecting safeguards
during construction.”

Section 3001 is amended by adding a new section to read “3001.1.1 Permitting
and inspections. Any elevator regulated by the State of Tennessee must be

City of Kingsport, Tennessee, Ordinance No. 6741, July 17, 2018 Page 1 of 7
Ref. AF: 154-2018



inspected and comply with all applicable State regulations. Any conflict between
this code and State Law, State Law shall prevail.”

(b) Existing Buildings Code. The provisions of the International Existing Buildings Code,
2018 edition, published by the International Code Council, are adopted by reference as
though copied verbatim in this subsection. One copy of said coede and revisions thereto
was on file in the office of the city recorder for a period of 15 days prior to adoption, and
that one copy of said code and revisions thereto shall remain on file in the office of the city
recorder for public use, inspection and examination. The International Existing Buildings
Code, 2018 edition is hereby amended as follows;

(1) Sections 112.1 through 112.3 pertaining to appeals is hereby deleted in its entirety
and in lieu thereof substituting the following:

“Section 112.1 General. In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions, or
determinations made by the code official relative to the application and interpretation
of this code shall be an issue by creating a board of appeals. The board of appeals as
referenced in the International Building Code, 2018 edition shall serve as the board of
appeals for the International Existing Buildings Code, 2018 edition.

Section 112.2 Limitations on authority. An application for appeal shall be based on a
claim that the true intent of this code or the rule legally adopted thereunder have been
incorrectly interpreted, the provisions of this code do not fully apply, or an egually good
or better form of construction is proposed. The board shall have no authority to waive
the requirements of this code.

Sections 112.3 Court review. Any aggrieved party may appeal the decision of the board
of appeals to the appropriate court by filing a petition for writ of common law certiorari
in the manner and time required by T.C.A. section 27-8-101."

(c) Property Maintenance Code. The provisions of the International Property Maintenance
Code, 2018 edition, published by the international Code Council, are adopted by reference
as though copied verbatim in this subsection. One copy of said code and revisions thereto
was on file in the office of the city recorder for a period of 15 days prior to adoption, and
that one copy of said code and revisions thereto shall remain on file in the office of the city
recorder for public use, inspection and examination. The International Property
Maintenance Code, 2018 edition is hereby amended as follows:

(1) Section 101.1 pertaining to title is amended by deleting the phrase “[name of
jurisdiction]” and in lieu thereof substituting the phrase “the City of Kingsport,
Tennessee.”

(2) Section 103.1 pertaining to general is amended by deleting the phrase “department
of property maintenance” and all such references in the code and in lieu thereof
substituting the phrase “building department, sometimes referenced as the buiiding
and codes division.”

(3) Section 103.5 pertaining to fees is amended by deleting the text in its entirety and
in lieu thereof substituting the following: Fees for activities and services performed by
the department in carrying out its responsibilities under this code shall be set by the
board of mayor and aldermen.

(4) Section 111 pertaining to means of appeal, including all subsections, is amended
by deleting the text of the section in its entirety and in lieu thereof substituting the
following:

City of Kingsport, Tennessee, Ordinance No. 6741, July 17, 2018 Page 2 of 7
Ref. AF: 154-2018



“111.1 Right to appeal. Any person directly affected by a decision of the
building official or a notice or order issued under this code shall have the right
to appeal to the city manager, or designee, provided that a written application
for appeal is filed within 20 days after the day the decision, notice or order was
served. An application for appeai shall be based on a claim that the true intent
of this code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been incorrectly
interpreted, the provisions of this code do not fully apply, or the requirements
of this code are adequately satisfied by other means. Appeals of notice and
orders (other than Imminent Danger notices) shall stay the enforcement of the
notice and order until the appeal is heard by the city manager or designee. A
hearing will be held before the city manager or designee at a time and place
therein fixed not less than ten days or more than thirty days after receipt of the
application for appeal. The appeliant and the city shall have the right to appear
and in person or by counsel and give festimony under oath at the place and
time fixed in the notice of the hearing. The rules of evidence prevailing in courts
of law or equity shall not be controlling in hearings before the city manager or
designee.

111.2 Decision in writing. The decision of the city manager or designee shall
be made in writing within ten business days following the hearing and a copy
shall be furnished to the appellant and to the code official.

111.3 Enforcement. The building official shall take immediate action in
accordance with the decision of the city manager or designee.

111.4 Appeal of decision of city manager or designee. Any aggrieved party
may appeal the decision of the city manager or designee to the appropriate
court by filing a petition for writ of common law certiorari in the manner and
time required by T.C.A. section 27-8-101. Any decision of the city manager or
designee will be effective during appeal unless otherwise stayed by a court of
competent jurisdiction.”

(5) Section 112.4 pertaining to failure to comply is amended by deleting the phrase
"not less than [AMOUNT] doltars or more than [AMOUNT] dollars” and in lieu thereof
substjtuting the phrase “up to fifty (50) dollars per day that the unauthorized work is
continued.”

(6) Section 302.4 pertaining to weeds is amended by deleting the text of the section in
its entirety and in lieu thereof substituting the following: All premises and exterior
property shall be maintained free from grass, weeds or uncultivated vegetation in
accordance with Sections 106-49 through 106-54 of the Kingsport City Code.

(7) Section 302.8 pertaining to motor vehicles is deleted in its entirety.

(8) Section 304.14 pertaining to insect screens is amended by deleting the phrase
"During the period from [DATE] to [DATE]."

(9) Section 602.3 pertaining to heat supply is amended by deleting the phrase "from
[DATE] to [DATE}"

(10) Section 602.4 pertaining to occupiable work spaces is amended by deleting the
phrase "from [DATE] to [DATE]."

(d) Energy Conservation Code. The provisions of the international Energy Conservation
Code, 2018 edition, published by the International Code Council, is hereby adopted by
reference as though copied verbatim in this subsection. One copy of said code and

City of Kingsport, Tennessee, Ordinance No. 6741, July 17, 2018 Page 3 of 7
Ref. AF: 154-2018



revisions thereto was on file in the office of the city recorder for a period of 16 days prior to
adoption, and that one copy of said code and revisions thereto shall remain on file in the
office of the city recorder for public use, inspection and examination. The International
Energy Conservation Code, 2018 edition is hereby amended as follows:

(1) Section C109.1 pertaining to board of appeals general is hereby amended by
adding a new sentence to read "The Board of Appeals as referenced in the
International Building Code, 2018 edition shall serve as the Board of Appeals for the
International Energy Conservation Code, 2018 edition.”

(2) Section R109.1 pertaining to board of appeals general is hereby amended by
adding a new sentence to read “The Board of Appeals as referenced in the
International Building Code, 2018 edition shall serve as the Board of Appeals for the
International Energy Conservation Code, 2018 edition.”

(e) Residential Code. The provisions of the International Residential Code, 2018 edition,
including appendix F, Q, and J for one and two-family dwellings, published by the
international Code Council, is hereby adopted by reference as though copied verbatim in
this subsection. One copy of said code and revisions thereto was on file in the office of the
city recorder for a period of 15 days prior to adoption, and that one copy of said code and
revisions thereto shall remain on file in the office of the city recorder for public use,
inspection and examination. The International Residential Code, 2018 edition is hereby
amended as follows:

(1) Section R104 is amending by adding a new secticn to read “R104.10.2 All
references to flood prone areas contained within this code shall comply with
Kingsport's duly adopted Flood Insurance Program requirements as shown on the
current Flood Insurance Rate Maps (FIRM) or the Flood Boundary and Floodway Maps
(FBFM) provided by the National Flood Insurance Program. Any conflicts between the
requirements contained herein and those contained in the Flood Insurance Program,
the duly adopted Flood Insurance Program shall apply.”

(2) Section R105.2 pertaining to work exempt from permit is amended by deleting the
phrase “200 square feet” and in lieu thereof substituting the phrase “120 square feet.”

(3) Section R105.2 pertaining to work exempt from permit is amended by deleting the
phrase “Fences not over 7 feet (2133 mm) high" and in lieu thereof substituting the
phrase “Fences not over 8 feet high.”

(4) Section R202 pertaining to definitions is pursuant to TCA § ©68-120-
101(a)(8)(C)(i)(a) amended by deleting the definition of TOWNHOUSE in its entirety
and in lieu thereof substituting the phrase "A single-family dwelling unit constructed in
a group of three or mare attached units in which each unit is separated by a 2 hour fire
wall extending from foundation to roof and with a yard or public way on not less than
two sides being exempt from sprinkier requirements of Section R313.1 and Section
P2904 of the International Residential Code, 2018 edition, however, if a sprinkler
system is installed it shall meet the requirements of these sections.”

{5) Pursuant to TCA 68-120-101(a)(8)(A), the sprinkler requirements in section R313.2
and section P2904 shall not be mandatory for One-and Twa Family Dwellings, provided
however, if a sprinkler system is installed it shall meet the requirements of section
R313.2 and section P2904.

(f) Accessibility Code. The provisions of the Chapter 11 of the International Building Code,
2018 edition, is hereby adopted by reference as though copied verbatim in this subsection.
One copy of said code and revisions thereto was on file in the office of the city recorder for

City of Kingsport, Tennessee, Ordinance No. 6741, July 17, 2018 Page 4 of 7
Ref: AF: 154-2018



a period of 15 days prior to adoption, and that one copy of said code and revisions thereto
shall remain on file in the office of the city recorder for public use, inspection, and
examination.

SECTION Il. That Section 22-121 of the Code of Ordinances, City of Kingsport,
Tennessee, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 22-121. Electrical code adopted by reference.

The provisions of the National Electrical Code 2017 edition published by the National Fire
Protection Association, is hereby adopted by reference as though copied verbatim herein.
One copy of said code and revisicns thereto was on the office of the city recorder for a
period of 15 days prior to adoption, and that one copy of said code and revisions thereto
shall remain on file in the office of the city recorder for public use, inspection and
examination.

SECTION lll. That Section 22-284 of the Code of Ordinances, City of Kingsport,
Tennessee, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 22-284. Code adopted by reference.

The provisions of the International Fuel Gas Code, 2018 edition, published by the
International Code Council, is hereby adopted by reference as though copied verbatim
herein. One copy of said code and revisions theretc was on file in the office of the city
recorder for a period of 15 days prior to adoption, and that one copy of said code and
revisions thereto shall remain on file in the office of the city recorder for public use,
inspection and examination. The International Fuel Gas Code, 2018 edition is hereby
amended as follows:

(1) Sections 109.2 through 109.7 pertaining to appeals is hereby deleted in its entirety
and in lieu thereof substituting the following:

“Section 109.2 Board of appeals. The board of appeals as referenced in the
International Building Code, 2018 edition shall serve as the board of appeals for
the International Fuel Gas Code, 2018 edition.

Section 109.3 Court review. Any aggrieved party may appeal the decision of the
board of appeals to the appropriate court by filing a petition for writ of common law
certiorari in the manner and time required by T.C.A. section 27-8-101."

SECTION IV. That Section 22-391 of the Code of Ordinances, City of Kingsport,
Tennessee, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 22-391 Code adopted by reference.

The provisions of the International Mechanical Code, 2018 edition, published by the
International Code council, is hereby adopted by reference as though copied verbatim
herein. One copy of said code and revisions thereto was on file in the office of the city
recorder for a period of 15 days prior to adoption, and that one copy of said code and
revisions thereto shall remain on file in the office of the city recorder for public use,
inspection and examination. The International Mechanical Code, 2018 edition is hereby
amended as follows:

(1) Sections 109.2 through 109.7 pertaining tc appeals is hereby deleted in its entirety
and in lieu thereof substituting the following:

City of Kingsport, Tennessee, Ordinance No. 6741, July 17, 2018 Page 50of 7
Ref: AF: 154-2018



“Section 109.2 Board of appeals. The board of appeals as referenced in the
International Building Code, 2018 edition shall serve as the board of appeals for
the International Mechanical Code, 2018 edition.

Section 109.3 Court review. Any aggrieved party may appeal the decision of the
board of appeals to the appropriate court by filing a petition for writ of common law
certiorari in the manner and time required by T.C.A. section 27-8-101."

SECTION V. That Section 22-411 of the Code of Ordinances, City of Kingsport,
Tennessee, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 22-411. Code adopted by reference.

The provisions of international Piumbing Code, 2018 editicn, published by the International
Code Council, is hereby adopted by reference as though copied verbatim herein. One copy
of said code and revisions thereto was on file in the office of the city recorder for a period
of 15 days prior to adoption, and that copy of said code and revisions there to shall remain
on file in the office of the city recorder for public use, inspection and examination. The
International Plumbing Code, 2018 edition is hereby amended as follows:

{1) Sections 109.2 through 109.7 pertaining to appeals is hereby deleted in its entirety
and in fieu thereof substituting the following:

“Section 109.2 Board of appeals. The board of appeals as referenced in the
International Building Code, 2018 edition shall serve as the board of appeals for
the International Plumbing Code, 2018 edition.

Section 109.3 Court review. Any aggrieved party may appeal the decision of the
board of appeals to the appropriate court by filing a petition for writ of common law
certiorari in the manner and time required by T.C.A. section 27-8-101."

SECTION VI. That Section 22-522 of the Code of Ordinances, City of Kingsport,
Tennessee, is hereby amended to read as follows

Sec. 22-522. Swimming Pool Code. Code adopted by reference.

The provisions of the international Swimming Pool and Spa Code, 2018 edition, published
by the International Code Council, is hereby adopted by reference as though copied
verbatim herein. One copy of said code and revisions thereto was on file in the office of the
city recorder for a period of 15 days prior to adoption, and that copy of said code and
revisions there to shall remain on file in the office of the city recorder for public use,
inspection and examination.

SECTION VII. That Se.ction 42-46 of the Code of Ordinances, City of Kingsport,
Tennessee, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 42-46. Code adopted by reference.

{a) The provisions of International Fire Code, 2018 edition, to include appendices A, B, C,
D, E F, G HIJ KL M and N, published by the International Code Council, is hereby
adopted by reference as though copied verbatim herein. One copy of said code and
revisions thereto was on file in the office of the city recorder for a period of 15 days prior to
adoption, and that cepy of said code and revisions there to shall remain on file in the office
of the city recorder for public use, inspection and examination.

City of Kingsport, Tennessee, Ordinance No. 6741, July 17, 2018 Page 6 of 7
Ref. AF:. 154-2018



{b) The fire official may utilize any of the codes, standards, manuals and recommended
practices contained within the National Fire Codes as a guide and/or reference in the
enforcement of fire protection and prevention provisions of the adopted codes.

SECTION ViIII. That this ordinance shall take effect from and after the date of its passage

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

\). W,«MF)L%

J. MICHAEL BILLINGGLEY/ City Attorney

PASSED CN 1ST READING: July 3, 2018

PASSED ON 2ND READING: July 17, 2018

City of Kingsport, Tennessee, Ordinance No. 6741, July 17, 2018 Page 7 of 7
Ref: AF: 154-2018



