

MINUTES
 BID OPENING
 January 25, 2022
 4:00 P.M.

Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Nikisha Eichmann, Assistant Procurement Manager; Lewis Bausell, Landscape Grounds Supervisor; and Tamera Rossi, Landscape Grounds Supervisor

The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room #436, 4th Floor, City Hall.

The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

MOWING & TRIMMING OF VARIOUS LOCATIONS				
Item #:	Clines Lawncare	Phillips Landscaping	Promier Landscaping	Dunn's Mowing Services
1	\$ 30.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 198.00	\$ 45.00
2	\$ 55.00	\$ 47.00	\$ 135.00	\$ 45.00
3	\$ 25.00	\$ 68.00	\$ 78.00	No Bid
4	\$ 115.00	\$ 172.00	\$ 770.00	\$ 225.00
5	\$ 150.00	\$ 170.00	\$ 947.00	No Bid
6	\$ 80.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 395.00	No Bid
7	\$ 150.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 829.00	\$ 225.00
8	\$ 120.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 790.00	\$ 125.00
9	\$ 30.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 135.00	\$ 35.00
10	\$ 30.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 75.00
11	\$ 30.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 130.00	\$ 45.00
12	\$ 60.00	\$ 38.00	\$ 535.00	\$ 125.00
13	\$ 75.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 850.00	No Bid
14	\$ 80.00	\$ 33.00	\$ 700.00	No Bid
15	\$ 100.00	\$ 72.00	\$ 880.00	\$ 125.00
16	\$ 100.00	\$ 58.00	\$ 800.00	\$ 325.00
17	\$ 50.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 550.00	\$ 35.00
18	\$ 65.00	\$ 68.00	\$ 490.00	No Bid
19	\$ 45.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 35.00
20	\$ 35.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 210.00	\$ 175.00
21	\$ 50.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 500.00	No Bid
22	\$ 60.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 740.00	No Bid
23	\$ 85.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 125.00
24	\$ 110.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 760.00	\$ 75.00

ALTERNATE 1				
Item #:	Clines Lawncare	Phillips Landscaping	Promier Landscaping	Dunn's Mowing Services
1	No Bid	\$ 135.00	\$ 1500.00	No Bid
2	No Bid	\$ 47.00	\$ 670.00	No Bid
3	No Bid	\$ 66.00	\$ 400.00	No Bid
4	No Bid	\$ 145.00	\$ 880.00	No Bid
5	No Bid	\$ 68.00	\$ 840.00	No Bid
6	No Bid	\$ 200.00	\$ 1,060.00	No Bid
7	No Bid	\$ 15.00	\$ 135.00	\$ 35.00
8	No Bid	\$ 47.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 75.00
9	No Bid	\$ 38.00	\$ 550.00	\$ 75.00
10	No Bid	\$ 40.00	\$ 820.00	No Bid
11	No Bid	\$ 170.00	\$ 2,800.00	No Bid
12	No Bid	\$ 15.00	\$ 130.00	\$ 35.00
13	No Bid	\$ 15.00	\$ 135.00	No Bid
14	No Bid	\$ 300.00	\$ 2,700.00	No Bid
15	No Bid	\$ 100.00	\$ 400.00	No Bid
16	No Bid	\$ 175.00	\$ 490.00	\$ 225.00
17	No Bid	\$ 55.00	\$ 500.00	No Bid
18	No Bid	\$ 70.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 75.00
19	No Bid	\$ 75.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 100.00

ALTERNATE 2				
Item #:	Clines Lawncare	Phillips Landscaping	Promier Landscaping	Dunn's Mowing Services
1	\$ 605.00	No Bid	\$ 680.00	No Bid

ALTERNATE 3				
Item #:	Clines Lawncare	Phillips Landscaping	Promier Landscaping	Dunn's Mowing Services
1	\$ 1,980.00	\$ 630.00	\$ 4,000.00	No Bid

The submitted bids will be evaluated and a recommendation made at a later date.