

MINUTES BID OPENING

November 10, 2021

4:00 P.M.

Present: Brent Morelock, Procurement Manager; Olivia Nickens, Procurement Specialist

The Bid Opening was held in the Conference Room # 436, 4th Floor, City Hall

The Procurement Manager opened with the following bids:

LIGHT DUTY AUTOMOTIVE REPAIR SERVICES										
Item	Qty.	U/I	Description	Kingsport Iron & Metal	Friendship Ford	Tri-Cities Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram	Almen Enterprises, LLC	Kubota of Kingsport	Central Hydraulics	Fairway Ford
				Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
01	1	EA	BODY & PAINT:							
			YEAR 1	\$95.00 /HR	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$128.00 /HR	No Bid	No Bid
			YEAR 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$136.00 /HR	No Bid	No Bid
			YEAR 3	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$144.00 /HR	No Bid	No Bid
02	1	EA	UNIBODY & FRAME:							
			YEAR 1	\$95.00 /HR	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$128.00 /HR	\$75.00 /HR	No Bid
			YEAR 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$136.00 /HR	\$80.00 /HR	No Bid
			YEAR 3	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$144.00 /HR	\$80.00 /HR	No Bid
03	1	EA	MECHANICAL:							
			YEAR 1	\$95.00 /HR	\$125.00 /HR	\$130.16 /HR	\$100.00 /HR	\$128.00 /HR	\$75.00 /HR	\$42.00 /HR
			YEAR 2	No Bid	\$135.00 /HR	\$120.16 /HR	\$105.00 /HR	\$136.00 /HR	\$80.00 /HR	No Bid
			YEAR 3	No Bid	\$145.00 /HR	\$115.16 /HR	\$110.00 /HR	\$144.00 /HR	\$80.00 /HR	No Bid
04	1	EA	MATERIAL COSTS (PAINT & PARTS) SHALL BE BASED ON COST + MARK-UP, SPECIFY PERCENTAGE MARK-UP:	10%	No Bid	25% Off List	15%	40%	20%	15%
05	1	EA	USED PARTS MARK-UP:	10%	40%	25% Off List	15%	40%	0%	15%
			ANY OTHER APPLICABLE FEES MUST BE SPECIFIED:		19% Discount on Ford Parts Excluding Oil Changes & Tires	Bronze Detail - Hand Wash & Dry, Tire Shine, Vacuum Vehicle \$35.00, Buses Extra; Gold Detail - Wash, Vacuum Seats & Carpets, Dash Board Cleaning, Vinyl Cleaning, Tire Shine \$110.00, Buses \$175.00	Road Service additional \$15 /HR. After hours Road Service additional \$35 /HR and a \$65 call out fee.	Shop Supplies \$20.00 per ticket		

The submitted bids will be evaluated and a recommendation made at a later date.